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in working memory and processing speed. Using the low trauma 
cluster as a reference, the neglect-focus group revealed a significant 
negative effect on the composite score (ß = -0.904, p = 0.025) and 
working memory (ß = -1.150, p = 0.002), after adjusting for con-
founding factors.
Conclusions:  Distinct patterns of childhood trauma experience are 
observed in BD patients and are associated with different cogni-
tive profiles. Early exposure to neglect-focus trauma is linked to the 
poorest cognitive performance in the current study. Further studies 
investigating the intensity of neglect, as well as individual resilience 
and coping mechanisms in BD, are warrant.
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RECURRENT PSYCHOTIC EPISODES 
FOLLOWING COVID-19 VACCINATION: A 
CASE REPORT
*Wen-Huei Siao
Taipei Tzu Chi Hospital, Buddhist Tzu Chi Medical Foundation

Background:  Acute neuropsychiatric symptoms induced by 
COVID-19 vaccination have been reported in several cases. Limbic 
encephalitis stands as one of the differential diagnoses due to its 
varied manifestations and etiologies making the diagnosis more 
challenging.
Aims & Objectives:  We present a case that experienced recurrent 
brief  psychotic symptoms and behavior changes with positive 
image findings following multiple doses of the Moderna COVID 
vaccine suggesting limbic encephalitis as a potential differential 
diagnosis.
Method:  We present a case of a 55-year-old man with a history 
of end-stage renal disease undergoing hemodialysis, and a history 
of heavy daily alcohol consumption abstaining for 10 years. After 
receiving the first dose of the Moderna COVID vaccine, he devel-
oped acute onset psychotic symptoms characterized by grandiose 
delusions, vivid auditory and visual hallucinations, and hearing 
conversations about his alleged past life as a great poet from the 
17th century who authored an enduring masterpiece. He remained 
capable of self-care but exhibited self-talking behaviors. The symp-
toms completely resolved within 2 weeks without any medication. 
The patient attributed the symptoms to a spiritual experience and 
continued to receive subsequent vaccine doses. These symptoms 
recurred in the same pattern lasting 2-4 weeks after receiving the 
second and third doses of the Moderna vaccine one month and five 
months after the initial dose. Around 6 months after the last dose, 
the patient experienced a similar recurrence of psychotic symptoms, 
with behavior disturbances which were accident proneness by self-
talking on a busy road. A mild, non-febrile upper respiratory tract 
infection was identified as a possible triggering factor, with normal 
blood tests. A brain magnetic resonance imaging revealed some 
old lacunar infarctions and symmetric hyperintensities in the me-
sial temporal lobe on T2 FLAIR. CSF showed normal in routine 
analysis and EEG was unremarkable. He demonstrated complete 
orientation and focused conversation but continued to experience 
auditory hallucinations and remained firmly convinced of his de-
lusions upon psychiatric visit without focal neurologic signs or 
abnormal movements. Serum and CSF autoantibody testing were 
declined and he received treatment with risperidone 1mg per day. 
The symptoms completely disappeared one week later.
Discussion & Conclusion:  Psychosis following COVID vaccination 
has been previously reported, but recurrent episodes after each 

administration have not been documented. Possible mechanisms 
may involve cytokines crossing the blood-brain barrier leading to 
acute neuroinflammation. The image findings and the polyphasic 
course make limbic encephalopathy the primary consideration of 
differential diagnoses. COVID vaccine-related autoimmune en-
cephalitis has been reported but only in cases with a single episode. 
Other differential diagnoses to consider include acute disseminated 
encephalomyelitis (ADEM), and reversible cerebral vasoconstric-
tion syndrome but lacks corresponding imaging evidence.
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*Yu-Li Liu1, Tung-Hsia Liu1, Chih-Hui Wang1, Hsiang-Wei Kuo1,  
Shiu-Feng Huang2, Hsiao-Hui Tsou3, Wei J. Chen1

1Center for Neuropsychiatric Research, National Health Research 
Institutes, Miaoli County, Taiwan, 2Institute of Molecular and 
Genomic Medicine, National Health Research Institutes, 3Institute 
of Population Health Sciences, National Health Research Institutes, 
Miaoli, Taiwan

Background:  COVID-19, which stands for Coronavirus Disease 
2019, is caused by SARS-CoV-2 coronavirus and primarily mani-
fests as a respiratory disease. However, the literature has reported 
its influence upon brain structure [1] and this observation finds 
additional support in the brain injury indicator, neurofilament light 
chain (NFL) [2]. Our NFL analysis in COVID-infected patients 
has indicated a correlation with the disease’ s severity. Nevertheless, 
the exact pathological pathway leading to brain neuronal injury 
remains elusive.
Aims & Objectives:  In our prior analyses, we presented the find-
ings on the NFL levels and their association with the syndrome ob-
served in COVID-19-infected patients. In this study, we extended 
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